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February 
2022

February 6

Nehemiah 1:5

Thank God for being 
mighty and awesome.

February 13

Nehemiah 2:3-5

Pray for the courage 
to speak up for God’s 
people.

February 20

Nehemiah 3:3, 12

Ask God to help us 
involve our families  
in His work.

February 27

Romans 12:4-5

Pray that we would see 
ourselves as one body 
working together.

February 7

Nehemiah 1:6-7

Confess ways we have 
sinned by violating 
Scripture.

February 14

Nehemiah 2:6-9

Pray we will see and use 
the resources God has 
given us for His work.

February 21

Nehemiah 3:5, 20

Pray we will do God’s 
work with excellence.

February 28

Romans 12:6-8

Ask God to help us use 
our gifts to benefit one 
another.

February 1

Nehemiah 1:1-2

Ask God to help us  
be aware of what is 
happening around us.

February 8

Nehemiah 1:8-9

Pray for God to help us 
follow Him.

February 15

Nehemiah 2:10

Pray we will be prepared 
to face opposition to 
God’s work.

February 22

Nehemiah 3:10, 23, 28

Ask for awareness about 
how our work for God 
helps us & our families.
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February 2

Matthew 7:1-5

Ask God to make us 
aware of and help us 
confront our own sins.

February 9

Nehemiah 1:10

Ask God to help us 
serve Him better.

February 16

Nehemiah 2:11-16

Ask God to help identify 
needs in family, church, 
and communities.

February 23

Nehemiah 3:14

Pray we will be willing 
to “get our hands dirty” 
to do God’s work.

February 3

Psalm 139:23-24

Ask God to reveal to us 
our wicked thoughts 
and ways.

February 10

Nehemiah 1:11

Ask God to give us clear 
opportunities to serve 
Him.

February 17

Nehemiah 2:17-18

Pray for wisdom as 
we enlist others in the 
Lord’s work.

February 24

Nehemiah 3:31-32

Pray everyone in your 
church will find a place 
in God’s work.

February 4

Nehemiah 1:3

Ask God to reveal “bro-
ken walls” where loved 
ones are vulnerable.

February 11

Nehemiah 2:1

Pray we will focus on 
the issues God has 
called us to address.

February 18

Nehemiah 2:19-20

Ask for wisdom in  
dealing with the  
enemies of the Lord.

February 25

Romans 12:1-2

Pray we would give our 
lives wholly to the Lord.

February 5

Nehemiah 1:4

Ask God to give us a 
heart for the needs of 
others.

February 12

Nehemiah 2:2

Ask God for an over-
whelming burden for 
His work.

February 19

Nehemiah 3:1-2, 4

Pray God will help us 
work well together.

February 26

Romans 12:3

Ask God to reveal how 
He made us and what 
He made us to do.
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